
                            #57 (Gray), #57 (Mexican), #89, #610 (Gray), #610 (Mexican) Limestone 

December 01, 2016 - 1:30 PM
Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation On-Line Bid # 0
     

#57 (Gray) Limestone East West Picked-up

Bear Industries Inc. 32.40$                     32.40$                   27.50$                      

Rene's Trucking 32.50$                     33.50$                   27.50$                      

Vulcan Materials 32.45$                     32.45$                   25.95$                      

Terrell Moran, Inc. 32.40$                     32.40$                   27.50$                      
Ernest Martine, Inc. 39.50$                     39.50$                   NO BID

#57 (Mexican) Limestone East West Picked-up

Bear Industries Inc. 31.90$                     31.90$                   NO BID

Rene's Trucking 31.50$                     32.50$                   26.50$                      
Vulcan Materials 30.40$                     30.40$                   23.90$                      
Terrell Moran, Inc. 29.00$                     29.00$                   23.50$                      
Ernest Martine, Inc. 37.00$                     37.00$                   NO BID

#89 Limestone East West Picked-up

Bear Industries Inc. 38.95$                     38.95$                   NO BID
Rene's Trucking NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vulcan Materials 34.30$                     34.30$                   27.80$                      
Terrell Moran, Inc. 35.50$                     35.50$                   31.50$                      
Ernest Martine, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID

#610 (Gray) Limestone East West Picked-up

Bear Industries Inc. 33.45$                     33.45$                   26.50$                      
Rene's Trucking 31.50$                     32.50$                   26.50$                      
Vulcan Materials 30.90$                     30.90$                   24.40$                      
Terrell Moran, Inc. 31.40$                     31.40$                   27.00$                      
Ernest Martine, Inc. 38.50$                     38.50$                   NO BID



#610 (Mexican) Limestone East West Picked-up

Bear Industries Inc. 28.73$                     28.73$                   NO BID

Rene's Trucking 27.73$                     28.73$                   21.73$                      

Vulcan Materials 26.85$                     26.85$                   20.70$                      

Terrell Moran, Inc. 27.75$                     27.75$                   23.50$                      

Ernest Martine, Inc. 33.00$                     33.00$                   NO BID
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