
PUMPED SAND & RIVER SILT

 DECEMBER 01, 2016 - 1:00PM

Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation

On-Line Bid/s #   0_______

Bidder/Pumped Sand Per Yard Stockpile Locations Alternate #1  (picked up)

Ernest Martine, Inc. $12.00 $12.00 NO BID

Bear Industries $16.00 $16.00 NO BID

Rene's Trucking, Inc. $10.50 $10.50 $5.50

Terrell Moran, Inc $10.00 $10.00 $5.50

Bidder/River Silt Per Yard Stockpile Locations Alternate #1  (picked up)

Ernest Martine, Inc. $11.00 $11.00 $4.00

Bear Industries                   NO BID                                  NO BID                                      NO BID

Rene's Trucking, Inc. $9.50 $9.50 $4.00

Terrell Moran, Inc $9.00 $9.00 $4.75

_______________________________________ _______________

Purchasing Department Date

_______________________________________ _______________

Purchasing Department Date


