
BRIDGE MATERIALS- BID

December 01, 2016 - 10:00 am

Ascension Parish Purchasing Department
On-Line Bid Received #   ____0_____

Bayou Forest Bayou Forest Bayou Forest

2 x 10 12' 20.50$                  3 x 10 12' 28.80$                 3 x 8 12' 22.60$                  

14' 23.75$                  14' 33.60$                 14' 26.20$                  

16' 27.50$                  16' 41.00$                 16' 32.00$                  

   18' 34.05$                  18' 48.05$                    18' 36.90$                  

20' 39.34$                  20' 53.75$                 20' 40.20$                  

22' 42.89$                  22' 64.63$                 22' 46.20$                  

24' 48.20$                  24' 67.80$                 24' 57.60$                  

26' 53.57$                  26' 75.40$                 26' 65.00$                  

28' NO BID 28' 85.05$                 28' 66.64$                  

30' NO BID 30' 94.88$                 30' 74.40$                  

32' NO BID 32' 106.00$               32' 82.88$                  

Bayou Forest Bayou Forest Bayou Forest
3 x 12 12' 39.80$                  4 x 12 12' 50.40$                 6 x 6 12' 32.40$                  

14' 46.10$                  14' 61.60$                 14' 37.80$                  

16' 56.24$                  16' 72.32$                 16' 43.20$                  

   18' 64.80$                  18' 86.40$                    18' 51.03$                  

20' 73.20$                  20' 93.60$                 20' 64.50$                  

22' 79.86$                  22' 106.48$               22' 68.64$                  

24' 99.00$                  24' 132.00$               24' 78.84$                  

26' 101.01$                26' 134.68$               26' 88.53$                  

28' 112.98$                28' 150.64$               28' 99.96$                  

30' 126.00$                30' 168.00$               30' 111.60$                

32' 139.20$                32' 185.60$               32' 124.32$                



Bayou Forest Bayou Forest Bayou Forest
6 x 8 12' 40.08$                  8 x 8 12' 53.44$                 12 x 12 12' 151.20$                

14' 46.76$                  14' 62.35$                 14' 176.40$                

16' 53.44$                  16' 71.26$                 16' 201.60$                

   18' 64.08$                  18' 85.44$                    18' 237.60$                

20' 75.60$                  20' 100.80$               20' 279.60$                

22' 86.68$                  22' 115.57$               22' 323.40$                

24' 99.84$                  24' 133.12$               24' 396.00$                

26' 112.84$                26' 150.45$               26' 447.16$                

28' 127.12$                28' 169.50$               28' 452.60$                

30' 142.80$                30' 190.40$               30' 507.60$                

32' 158.72$                32' 211.63$               32' 556.80$                

Bayou Forest
Class B 25' Piling 265.00$                

Class B 40' Piling 325.00$                

MCM Lumber MCM Lumber MCM Lumber
2 x 10 12' 19.90$                  3 x 10 12' 27.00$                 3 x 8 12' 21.00$                  

14' 23.00$                  14' 32.00$                 14' 25.00$                  

16' 27.00$                  16' 38.00$                 16' 36.00$                  

   18' 31.00$                  18' 45.00$                    18' 35.00$                  

20' 34.00$                  20' 50.00$                 20' 40.00$                  

22' 39.00$                  22' 58.00$                 22' 47.00$                  

24' 42.00$                  24' 61.00$                 24' 53.00$                  

26' NO BID 26' 75.00$                 26' 61.00$                  

28' NO BID 28' 84.00$                 28' 69.00$                  

30' NO BID 30' 90.00$                 30' 75.00$                  

32' NO BID 32' 104.00$               32' 87.00$                  



MCM Lumber MCM Lumber MCM Lumber
3 x 12 12' 32.00$                  4 x 12 12' 39.00$                 6 x 6 12' 30.00$                  

14' 38.00$                  14' 52.00$                 14' 34.00$                  

16' 46.00$                  16' 60.00$                 16' 44.00$                  

   18' 54.00$                  18' 70.00$                    18' 50.00$                  

20' 63.00$                  20' 83.00$                 20' 58.00$                  

22' 71.00$                  22' 95.00$                 22' 68.00$                  

24' 82.00$                  24' 109.00$               24' 78.00$                  

26' 92.00$                  26' 122.00$               26' 88.00$                  

28' 102.00$                28' 138.00$               28' 95.00$                  

30' 112.00$                30' 155.00$               30' 108.00$                

32' 128.00$                32' 170.00$               32' 120.00$                

MCM Lumber MCM Lumber MCM Lumber
6 x 8 12' 42.00$                  8 x 8 12' 50.00$                 12 x 12 12' 131.00$                

14' 46.00$                  14' 61.00$                 14' 154.00$                

16' 57.00$                  16' 76.00$                 16' 182.00$                

   18' 70.00$                  18' 92.00$                    18' 208.00$                

20' 81.00$                  20' 106.00$               20' 247.00$                

22' 93.00$                  22' 124.00$               22' 283.00$                

24' 108.00$                24' 142.00$               24' 325.00$                

26' 120.00$                26' 161.00$               26' 370.00$                

28' 132.00$                28' 182.00$               28' 410.00$                

30' 153.00$                30' 201.00$               30' 465.00$                

32' 160.00$                32' 215.00$               32' 519.00$                

MCM Lumber
Class B 25' Piling 192.00$                Purchasing Department Date

Class B 40' Piling 211.00$                

Purchasing Department Date



______________________________________________________

Purchasing Department Date

______________________________________________________

Purchasing Department Date


