
Polyvinyl Chloride (PVC) Sewer/Drainage Pipe

September 13, 2016 - 10:30 AM
   Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation
On-Line Bids Received #   2_

Bid/Per Foot

Bidder 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48"

Coburn's Inc. 5.36$       7.67$       11.00$     19.80$     19.84$     27.21$     39.89$     No Bid No Bid 

Sorrento Lumber 7.90$       11.32$     16.23$     27.71$     29.27$     37.96$     61.93$     No Bid No Bid 

Quality Sitework Materials 5.70$       8.16$       11.70$     19.98$     21.10$     28.73$     44.65$     No Bid No Bid 

HD Supply Waterworks 5.60$       8.03$       11.55$     19.75$     20.79$     28.52$     43.85$     No Bid No Bid 

Costal Culvert & Supply, Inc. 6.14$       8.80$       12.62$     21.56$     22.77$     31.21$     48.17$     No Bid No Bid 

Cimsco, Inc. 5.90$       8.40$       11.90$     20.50$     21.75$     29.50$     43.90$     83.50$     99.45$     

_______________________________________ _______________

Purchasing Department Date

_______________________________________ _______________

Purchasing Department Date


