
            MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
           Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

                      July 14, 2016 - 10:00 am
  Bid Tabulation On Line Bid   1  

pg 1

Scourge Biomist Duet Masterline BVA-2 MSDS

Bidder 5 gal 30+30 2.5 gal Bifenthrin 7.9 55 gallon Sheet

2.5 gal 1 quart drum

Clarke Mosquito

Control

 Mosquito Master 412

$63.00 per gal.

in 30 gal. drum

NON-RESPONSIVE 

 $52.11

per gal. 

 $144.30

per gal. 
NO BID

 Coco Bear

$16.85 per gal. 
√

Univar USA NO BID

 Kontrol 30-30

$53.72 

per gallon 

NO BID
 $12.50

per quart 

 Master Larvicide

(Kontrol) Oil

$7.94 per gallon 
√

Southern Chem NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID √

Adapco, Inc.

 Scourge 18-54

$488.95

per gallon 

 Perm-X UL 30-30

$56.94 per gal.

Permanone 30-30

$55.72 per gallon 

NO BID

 Wisdom TC 

Flowable

$16.50 per quart  

 $8.85

per gal 
√



            MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
           Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

                      July 14, 2016 - 10:00 am

  Bid Tabulation
pg 2

Vectolex Vectolex Altosid Clear Mineral Clear Mineral MSDS

Bidder CG WDG Briquets Oil -   50 gals in Oil -  Sheet

40 lb bag (24) 1 lb 400/case 55 gal drum 280 gallon tote

Clarke Mosquito

Control

Vectolex FG

$6.22

per lb.

 $69.00

per lb. 

$448.00

per case
NO BID NO BID √

Univar USA NO BID NO BID
$448.00

per case

MaxPar G2-60

$5.68 per gallon
NO BID √

Southern Chem NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hyprint L60

$5.30

per gallon

Hyprint L60

$5.20

per gallon
√

Adapco, Inc.
 Spheratax SPH (50G)

$6.05 per lb. 
NO BID

$448.00

per case

"Won Coin Toss"

Calpar 80 N

$6.26 per gal

Calpar 80 N

$6.26 per gal

in 275 gal tote

NON-RESPONSIVE

√

Purchasing Department                                                                                                                                                               Date: July 14, 2016

Purchasing Department                                                                                                                                                Date: July 14, 2016


