CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE, TEE'S & FITTINGS
TABULATION SHEET

July 12, 2016 10:00 AM
ONLINEBID_ 0O

Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe

Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert
15" S 6.95 | S 6.46 | S 734 S 6.89 | S 7.00
18" S 9.75 | S 955 | S 1085 | S 10.18 [ S 10.00
21" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" S 1525 (S 14.86 | S 16.89 | S 1585 (S 15.50
30" S 24,50 | S 23.58 | S 26.80 | S 25.15 | S 25.00
36" S 30.00 | S 2840 | S 3227 | S 30.30 | S 30.00
42" S 39.70 | S 3892 (S 4423 | S 4152 |$ 42.00
48" S 49.30 | S 4832 | S 5491 |S 51.55 | $ 52.00
54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" S 83.00 | S 81.76 | S 9291 (S 87.24 | S 85.00
Sure Lok Tee
Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert

15" S 408.00 | S 363.70 | 591.90 | $ 181.89 | S 350.00
18" S 599.00 | $ 533.71 | $ 77838 | S 255.17 | $ 240.00
21" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" S 1,228.00 | $ 1,092.92 | $ 1,559.62 | $ 394.49 | S 375.00
30" S 1,705.00 | S 1,517.73 | $ 2,165.84 | S 796.08 | $ 750.00
36" S 1,876.00 | $ 1,670.19 | $ 2,383.41 | $ 1,070.93 | $ 1,020.00
42" S 3,640.00 | S 3,238.82 | S 4,201.72 | S 1,554.27 | S 1,450.00
48" S 3,927.00 | S 3,495.17 | S 4,026.43 | S 1,829.10 | S 1,745.00
54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" S 5,331.00 | S 4,744.07 | S 5,465.17 | S 3,866.71 | $ 3,650.00




Corrugated Polyethylene Fittings

Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert

22° (22.5)

15" S 207.00 | S 184.45 | S 404.05 180.68 | S 77.00
18" S 251.00 | $ 223.69 444.59 219.13 | $ 105.00
21" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" S 450.00 | S 400.65 | S 637.84 | S 392.47 | $ 225.00
30" S 916.00 | § 815.86 | $ 1,164.26 | S 799.22 | § 350.00
36" S 1,166.00 | $ 1,038.05 | $ 1,481.33 | $ 1,016.87 | $ 500.00
42" S 1,522.00 | $ 1,354.75 | $ 1,933.26 | $ 1,327.12 | $ 700.00
48" S 1,963.00 | $ 1,747.98 | $ 2,376.81 | S 1,712.33 | S 820.00
54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" S 3,803.00 | S 3,384.82 | S 4,289.24 | S 3,315.78 | $ 1,340.00

Corrugated Polyethylene Fittings

Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert

45°

15" S 220.00 | S 195.94 | S 404.05 | S 22738 | $ 94.00
18" S 291.00 | S 259.41 462.16 | S 288.94 | S 125.00
21" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" S 495.00 | S 440.90 | S 641.89 | S 528.78 | $ 258.00
30" S 998.00 | $ 888.67 | S 1,152.87 | $ 957.59 | $ 400.00
36" S 1,366.00 | S 1,216.51 | S 1,578.18 | S 1,331.56 | S 610.00
42" S 2,072.00 | § 1,844.44 | S 2,392.78 | § 1,914.46 | S 875.00
48" S 2,447.00 | $ 2,177.99 | $ 2,825.50 | $ 2,402.67 | S 1,122.00
54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" S 4,882.00 | S 4,344.42 | S 5,004.77 | S 3,997.31 (S 1,700.00




Corrugated Polyethylene Fittings

Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert

90°

15" S 255.00 22731 (S 434.27 114.49 109.00
18" S 325.00 290.09 508.00 160.63 152.00
21" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" S 530.00 | $ 47194 | S 668.92 | S 31761 | S 300.00
30" S 1,126.00 | S 1,002.67 | S 1,300.00 | $ 657.35 | $ 625.00
36" S 1,660.00 | $ 1,477.90 | $ 1,917.27 | $ 875.85 | $ 855.00
42" S 2,266.00 | S 2,017.32 | S 2,617.07 | $ 1,282.13 | $ 1,225.00
48" S 2,602.00 | $ 2,316.32 | S 3,004.96 | $ 1,544.03 | $ 1,475.00
54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" S 5,008.00 | S 4,457.07 | S 513451 (S 2,683.95 S 2,565.00

Sure Lok Reducing Tee

Coburn's Inc.

Ind Mun. Supply

Sorrento Lumber

Quality Site Work

Coastal Culvert

15" x 8" S 320.00 NOBID | $ 520.12 | S 279.30 | S 155.00
15" x 10" S 350.00 NOBID | $ 545.95 | S 306.10 | S 165.00
15" x 12" S 355.00 NOBID | $ 566.22 | S 309.83 | S 170.00
18" x 8" S 413.00 NOBID | $ 628.38 [ S 360.85 | S 157.00
18 x 10" S 455.00 NOBID | S 662.16 | S 396.66 | S 185.00
18" x 12" S 528.00 NOBID | S 717.57 | S 461.02 | S 195.00
18" x 15" S 535.00 | $ 476.82 | S 72432 | S 467.09 | S 235.00
21" x 8" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21" x 10" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21" x 15" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21" x 18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" x 8" S 628.00 NOBID | S 813.51 | S 548.38 | S 240.00
24" x 10" S 687.00 NOBID | $ 877.03 | S 600.27 | S 254.00
24" x 12" S 693.00 NOBID | $ 885.14 | S 605.47 | S 310.00




Sure Lok Reducing Tee

Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert
24" x 15" S 733.00 | $ 653.39 | S 941.84 | S 640.06 | $ 320.00
24" x 18" S 827.00 | S 736.40 | S 1,061.46 | S 72137 | S 650.00
30" x 12" S 980.00 NOBID | S 1,170.92 | $ 854.39 | S 695.00
30" x 15" S 1,087.00 | S 968.32 | $ 1,281.15 | S 948.57 | $§ 460.00
30" x 18" S 1,170.00 | $ 1,041.13 | $ 1,379.15 | $ 1,019.88 | $ 560.00
30" x 24" S 1,515.00 | 1,348.79 | $ 1,790.76 | $ 1,321.28 | $ 740.00
36" x 12" S 1,308.00 NOBID | $ 1,599.00 | $ 1,140.98 | $ 745.00
36" x 15" S 1,450.00 | $ 1,291.10 | $ 1,73095 | $ 1,264.77 | $ 752.00
36" x 18" S 1,496.00 | $ 1,332.30 | $ 1,781.85 | $ 1,305.13 | $ 800.00
36" x 24" S 1,690.00 | S 1,504.00 | S 2,010.95 | $§ 1,473.32 | S 950.00
42" x 12" S 2,183.00 NOBID | S 2,630.28 | S 1,903.88 | $ 715.00
42" x 15" S 2,230.00 | $ 1,984.73 | $ 2,672.28 | S 1,944.24 | $ 775.00
42" x 18" S 2,312.00 | $ 2,057.52 | $ 2,842.76 | S 2,015.55 [ S 950.00
42" x 24" S 2,431.00 | $ 2,163.28 | $ 2,905.19 | $ 2,119.16 | $ 1,150.00
42" x 30" S 2,477.00 | 2,204.49 | S 2,941.19 | $ 2,159.52 [ S 1,350.00
42" x 36" S 2,925.00 | $ 2,603.02 | $ 3,492.97 | $ 2,549.92 [ S 1,520.00
48" x 12" S 2,230.00 NOBID | S 2,663.87 | S 1,944.24 | S 720.00
48" x 15" S 2,261.00 | $§ 2,012.20 | $ 2,690.60 | $ 1,971.15 | S 800.00
48" x 18" S 2,392.00 | $ 2,128.95 | $ 2,868.78 | $ 2,085.52 | $ 955.00
48" x 24" S 2,600.00 | § 2,31436 | S 3,064.78 | $ 2,267.16 | $ 1,285.00
48" x 30" S 2,825.00 | $ 2,514.07 | $ 3,396.39 | 2,462.80 | S 1,480.00
48" x 36" S 3,220.00 | S 2,865.15 | $ 3,818.87 | $ 2,806.71 | S 1,650.00
48" x 42" S 3,611.00 | S 3,214.02 | S 4,321.35 | S 3,148.47 | S 1,900.00
54" x 15" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54" x 18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54" x 24" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54" x 30" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54" x 36" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54" x 42" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54" x 48" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Sure Lok Reducing Tee

Coburn's Inc. Ind Mun. Supply Sorrento Lumber Quality Site Work Coastal Culvert

60" x 12" S 4,172.00 NOBID | S 4,610.78 | $ 3,478.76 | $ 2,000.00
60" x 15" S 4,332.00 | $ 3,855.45 | S 4,72411 | S 3,612.60 | $ 2,050.00
60" x 18" S 4,590.00 | $ 4,084.82 | S 5,036.41 | S 3,827.53 | $ 2,675.00
60" x 24" S 4,898.00 | S 4,359.53 | S 5,356.03 | S 4,084.93 | S 2,985.00
60" x 30" S 5,076.00 | S 4,517.48 | S 4,954.05 | $ 4,23294 | S 3,100.00
60" x 36" S 5,423.00 | S 4,826.52 | S 5,988.95 | S 4,522.51 (S 3,350.00
60" x 42" S 5,732.00 | S 5,101.22 | S 6,294.34 | $§ 4,779.91 | S 3,500.00
60" x 48" S 6,136.00 | S 5,459.71 | S 6,835.48 | § 5,115.82 | $ 3,600.00
Ascension Parish Purchasing Department Date

Ascension Parish Purchasing Department Date




