
3M TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & SUPPLIES

Ascension Parish Purchasing Department

June 21, 2016 - 11:00 am

BID TABULATION

On-Line Bids   0   

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

3M DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING Traffic Control Products Trantex Transportation Vulcan Signs

“S” Curve Left, Black, & Yellow - 30” 53.63$                                   66.17$                               42.25$                                 

“S” Curve Right, Black, & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.17$                               42.25$                                 

10’ U-Channel Green Post Galvanized 21.00$                                   15.40$                               14.60$                                 

2” A-frame Barricade 39.75$                                   75.10$                               120.07$                              
3-Way Sign 6” x 12” Black & White 4.50$                                      5.30$                                 3.94$                                   

4-Way Sign 6” x 12” Black & White 4.50$                                      5.30$                                 3.94$                                   

5/16 Bolts, Nuts, Washer to install signs $                         .37 each $                   19.82 box $                         .20 set

6'-1/2" Green Post (for object markers) 13.66$                                   NO BID 9.49$                                   

7’ Green Post (for object markers) 14.75$                                   NO BID 10.22$                                 

90 Degree Curve Left, Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

90 Degree Curve Right, Black & Yellow – 30’ 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 5 MPH -– 18 X 18 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.57$                                 

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 10 MPH – 18 X 18 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.57$                                 

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 15 MPH – 18 X 18 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.57$                                 

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 20 MPH – 18 X 18 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.57$                                 

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 25 MPH – 18 X 18 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.57$                                 

All-Way Sign 6” x 18” Black & White 6.50$                                      7.94$                                 5.56$                                   

Bracket 91UFOL 5.25$                                      3.72$                                 3.00$                                   

Dead End Sign 24” x 24” Black & Yellow 31.50$                                   42.35$                               27.04$                                 

Handicap Reserved Parking with Symbol – 12X18 11.95$                                   15.88$                               10.84$                                 

Large Arrow – 48X24 62.92$                                   84.70$                               54.08$                                 

Large Double Arrow – 48X24 62.92$                                   84.70$                               54.08$                                 

No Outlet Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 



BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

3M DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING Traffic Control Products Trantex Transportation Vulcan Signs

No Parking Sign 12” x 18” 11.95$                                   15.88$                               10.40$                                 

Normal Curve Left  Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Normal Curve Right Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Object Marker Left  12” x 36” 23.75$                                   31.75$                               20.76$                                 

Object Marker Right 12” x 36” 23.75$                                   31.75$                               20.76$                                 

Railroad Advance Warning 36” diameter 62.95$                                   95.30$                               59.65$                                 

Red Diamond (End of Roadway) 18” x 18” 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.56$                                 

Reverse Curve Sign Left, Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Reverse Curve Sign Right, Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Reverse Turn Sign Left, Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Reverse Turn Sign Right, Black & Yellow – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Slow Children at Play Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 10 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 15 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 20 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 25 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 30 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 35 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 40 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 45 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Speed Limit 50 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Stop Ahead Message – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

Stop Ahead Symbol – 30” 53.63$                                   66.18$                               43.13$                                 

Stop Signs 30” x 30” Red 53.63$                                   66.18$                               41.44$                                 

Standard Size Sign 6 x 18 6.50$                                      7.94$                                 5.56$                                   

Standard Size Sign 6 x 24 8.75$                                      11.00$                               7.01$                                   

Standard Size Sign 6 x 30 10.75$                                   13.25$                               8.69$                                   

Standard Size Sign 6 x 36 12.95$                                   15.88$                               10.44$                                 

Standard Size Sign 12 x 18 11.95$                                   15.88$                               10.40$                                 

Standard Size Sign 18 x 18 19.50$                                   23.82$                               15.56$                                 



BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

3M DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING Traffic Control Products Trantex Transportation Vulcan Signs

Standard Size Sign 18 x 24 25.75$                                   31.75$                               20.55$                                 

Standard Size Sign 24 x 24 31.50$                                   42.35$                               27.04$                                 

Standard Size Sign 26 x 24 37.25$                                   45.87$                               29.27$                                 

Standard Size Sign 30 x 24 42.90$                                   52.94$                               33.80$                                 

Standard Size Sign 30 x 30 53.63$                                   66.18$                               42.25$                                 

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC SHEETING Traffic Control Products Trantex Transportation Vulcan Signs

“S” Curve Left, Black, & Yellow - 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

“S” Curve Right, Black, & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

10’ U-Channel Green Post Galvanized 21.00$                                   15.40$                               17.88$                                 

2” A-frame Barricade 39.75$                                   75.10$                               82.04$                                 
3-Way Sign 6” x 12” Black & White 2.95$                                      4.71$                                 2.46$                                   

4-Way Sign 6” x 12” Black & White 2.95$                                      4.71$                                 2.46$                                   

5/16 Bolts, Nuts, Washer to install signs $                         .37 each $                  19.82 box $                         .20 set

6'-1/2" Green Post (for object markers) 13.66$                                   NO BID 9.49$                                   

7’ Green Post (for object markers) 14.75$                                   NO BID 10.22$                                 

90 Degree Curve Left, Black & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

90 Degree Curve Right, Black & Yellow – 30’ 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 5 MPH -– 18 X 18 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.75$                                   

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 10 MPH – 18 X 18 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.75$                                   

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 15 MPH – 18 X 18 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.75$                                   

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 20 MPH – 18 X 18 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.75$                                   

Advisory Speed Black & Yellow 25 MPH – 18 X 18 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.75$                                   

All-Way Sign 6” x 18” Black & White 3.95$                                      7.06$                                 3.34$                                   

Bracket 91UFOL 5.25$                                      3.72$                                 3.00$                                   



BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC SHEETING Traffic Control Products Trantex Transportation Vulcan Signs

Dead End Sign 24” x 24” Black & Yellow 18.75$                                   37.65$                               15.04$                                 

Handicap Reserved Parking with Symbol – 12X18 7.50$                                      14.12$                               6.34$                                   

Large Arrow – 48X24 37.50$                                   75.29$                               30.08$                                 

Large Double Arrow – 48X24 37.50$                                   75.29$                               30.08$                                 

No Outlet Black & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

No Parking Sign 12” x 18” 7.50$                                      14.12$                               5.90$                                   

Normal Curve Left  Black & Yellow – 30” 37.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Normal Curve Right Black & Yellow – 30” 37.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Object Marker Left  12” x 36” 14.50$                                   28.24$                               11.76$                                 

Object Marker Right 12” x 36” 14.50$                                   28.24$                               11.76$                                 

Railroad Advance Warning 36” diameter 42.50$                                   84.71$                               32.64$                                 

Red Diamond (End of Roadway) 18” x 18” 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.81$                                   

Reverse Curve Sign Left, Black & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Reverse Curve Sign Right, Black & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Reverse Turn Sign Left, Black & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Reverse Turn Sign Right, Black & Yellow – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Slow Children at Play Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 10 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 15 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 20 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 25 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 30 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 35 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 40 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 45 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Speed Limit 50 Sign 18” x 24” Black & White 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Stop Ahead Message – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Stop Ahead Symbol – 30” 29.50$                                   58.82$                               24.81$                                 

Stop Signs 30” x 30” Red 29.50$                                   58.82$                               22.68$                                 

Standard Size Sign 6 x 18 3.95$                                      7.06$                                 3.34$                                   



BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC SHEETING Traffic Control Products Trantex Transportation Vulcan Signs

Standard Size Sign 6 x 24 4.75$                                      9.41$                                 4.15$                                   

Standard Size Sign 6 x 30 5.90$                                      11.76$                               5.12$                                   

Standard Size Sign 6 x 36 7.15$                                      14.12$                               5.94$                                   

Standard Size Sign 12 x 18 7.50$                                      14.12$                               5.90$                                   

Standard Size Sign 18 x 18 10.60$                                   21.18$                               8.81$                                   

Standard Size Sign 18 x 24 14.25$                                   28.24$                               11.55$                                 

Standard Size Sign 24 x 24 18.75$                                   37.65$                               15.04$                                 

Standard Size Sign 26 x 24 20.50$                                   40.78$                               16.28$                                 

Standard Size Sign 30 x 24 23.50$                                   47.06$                               18.80$                                 

Standard Size Sign 30 x 30 29.50$                                   58.82$                               23.50$                                 

Purchasing Department                                                  Date: 6/21/16

Purchasing Department                                                  Date: 6/21/16


